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CITY OF LAKE CHARLES - BID TABULATION
ANNUAL SUPPLY OF PUBLIC SAFTEY UNIFORMS
BID #2024-21

ITEM # DESCRIPTION

ACADIAN 
PROMOTIONAL

PRODUCTS TEECO SAFETY

Category I. FIRE - FIRST TACTICAL
1F First Tactical Short Sleeve Shirt 112007 (men), 122007 (women) 62.99 53.29

2F First Tactical Long Sleeve Shirt 111006 (men), 121006 (women) 67.99 59.85

3F First Tactical Class-B PDU Cargo Pants 114011 (men), 124011 (women) 65.00 57.39

4F First Tactical Twill PDU Class-A Short Sleeve Shirt 112001 (men), 122001 (women) 65.00 57.39

5F First Tactical Twill PDU Class-A Long Sleeve Shirt 111011 (men), 121011 (women) 70.00 64.49

6F First Tactical Class-A PDU Four (4) Pocket Pants 114018 (men), 124018 (women) 62.00 55.24

7F First Tactical Class-A PDU Six (6) Pocket Pants 114041 (men), 124041 (women) 65.00 57.39

8F First Tactical Tactix System Parka

      Parka length 118500 (men), 128500 (women) 349.99 326.98

      Jacket length 118502 (men), 128502 (women) 349.99 326.98
9F First Tactical Performance Polo Short Sleeve Shirt 112509/112509T (men),

122509 (women) 47.50 38.53

10F First Tactical Performance Polo Long Sleeve Shirt 111503 (men), 121503 (women) 49.50 40.99

11F First Tactical ¼ Zip Job Shirt 118507 72.99 64.49

Category II. FIRE - 5.11
1F 5.11 3-IN-1 Parka 2.0 48358 259.99 229.00

Category III. FIRE - SOUTHEASTERN
1F Southeastern Code 3 Short Sleeve Shirt Z3202 55.00 no bid

2F Southeastern Code 3 Long Sleeve Shirt Z3102 60.00 no bid
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Category IV. FIRE - SPIEWAK
1F Spiewak FIRE Uniform Short Sleeve Shirt SU310ZS (men), SU311ZS (women) 61.95 no bid

2F Spiewak FIRE Uniform Long Sleeve Shirt SU315ZS (men), SU316ZS (women) 65.95 no bid

Category V. FIRE - BLUE GEN
1F Blue Gen Short Sleeve Shirt BG-26185 *correct #BG-6218S 31.99 no bid

2F Blue Gen ¾ Sleeve Shirt BG-6218 32.49 no bid

3F Blue Gen Long Sleeve Shirt BG-6216 32.59 no bid

Category VI. FIRE - EDWARDS
1F Edwards Pants 8550 36.50 no bid

Category VII. FIRE - LIBERTY
1F Liberty Reversible Rain Coat 586MFL 89.95 no bid

Category VIII. FIRE - VARIOUS
1F Boston Garrison Belt 6605 22.95 no bid

2F Badges 5592 131.50 no bid

3F Name plates 10.00 no bid

Category I. POLICE - SPIEWAK
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1P Spiewak Deluxe Softshell Jacket/Liner S318ZX 124.99 no bid

2P Spiewak Uniform Trouser SU322 (men), SU322W (women) 68.50 no bid

3P Spiewak Hidden Cargo Uniform Trouser SU320 (men), SU320W (women) 71.95 no bid

4P Spiewak Police Uniform Shirt Short Sleeve SU310ZS (men), SU311ZS (women) 61.95 no bid

5P Spiewak Police Uniform Shirt Long Sleeve SU315ZS (men), SU316ZS (women) 65.95 no bid

6P Spiewak Base Layer Uniform Shirt Short Sleeve SBLBP30 *correct #SBLBPP30 49.00 no bid

7P Spiewak Base Layer Uniform Shirt Long Sleeve SBLBP35 52.00 no bid

Category II. POLICE - PROPPER
1P Propper I.C.E. Performance Polo Short Sleeve F5327 (women) 39.99 33.79

2P Propper I.C.E. Performance Polo Long Sleeve F5357 (women) 45.99 39.99

3P Propper I.C.E. Performance Polo Short Sleeve F5341 (men) 39.99 33.79

4P Propper I.C.E. Performance Polo Long Sleeve F5315 (men) 45.99 39.99

Category III. POLICE - 5.11
1P 5.11 Performance Polo Short Sleeve 71049 (men) 47.50 39.36

2P 5.11 Performance Polo Short Sleeve 61165 (women) 47.50 39.69

3P 5.11 Stryke Short 73327 69.99 64.00

4P 5.11 Motorcycle Breeches 74407 138.00 113.00

5P 5.11 Apex Pant 74434 85.00 72.00

6P 5.11 Helios Short Sleeve Polo 71192 47.50 37.69
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7P 5.11 Stratos ¼ Zip 72235 (men), 72417 (women) 71.50 59.00

8P 5.11 Stratos Full Zip 72244 (men), 72424 (women) 72.50 63.79

9P 5.11 Stryke Pants 74369 (men), 74386 (women) 79.00 68.24

Category IV. POLICE - VARIOUS
1P Premier Uniform-Reflective Traffic Vest 29.95 no bid

2P Liberty Reversible Rain Coat 586MFL 89.95 no bid

3P Bianchi Flashlight Carrier 22096 19.95 16.75

4P Premier Neck Tie PT1202 7.00 no bid

5P Bianchi Hidden Snap Belt Keepers 18.75 14.97

6P “P” Buttons, Waterbury 1.95 no bid
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